
Happy Friday!!  

 Thank you all for a 
successful Croc Mile! As of this 
morning our class has raised 
$1,197.50!  As I shared in the 
weekly email, you can continue 
collecting donation until Octo-

ber 20th! 

 

 Today in math we 
started our new unit on multi-
plication. In this unit students 
will be learning strategies for 
multi-digit by multi-digit multi-
plication. I will be posting vide-
os with tips and trick in the 
resource section of our class 
website, as well as on Class 
Dojo. You can help your child 
prepare for this unit by contin-
uing to build fluency with mul-

tiplication facts 0-12.  

 

 Please remember 
that next Friday is track-out 
day. It is also an early release 
day. Next Friday is also the day 
that the students have their 

timed mile run, so they will 
need to wear their tennis 
shoes to school. The timed 
mile had to be postponed due 

to Croc Mile. 

 

 That covers every-
thing for this week! Have a safe 

and fun-filled weekend! 

 

Don’t forget to keep collecting 

and sending in Box Tops! 

 

A Note from Mrs. Atkins 

Next Weeks Objectives & Important Dates 

Word Work:  Meaning of Un-

known Words 

Writing: Narratives 

Reading: Point of View 

Math: Multiplication 

Science: Animal Adaptations 

Social Studies: Establishing 

North Carolina 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Important Dates: 

Sept. 28th– Zoo Field Trip 

Sept. 29th– Early Release/

Track Out 

Sept. 29th– Online Scholastic 

Book Orders Due 
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NEXT WEEKS SPECIALS: 

Happy Birthday: 

 Sept. 17th– Claire 

Mrs. A. Atkins 
aatkins@wcpss.net  

(919) 841-

4333  


